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“Objective liability” is mostly used to denote a form of liability where, in contrast to classic 
responsibility, no wrongful act is required. While the notion of “objective liability” is well defined 
and clear in municipal law, it has been proved to be a controversial one in international law. 
In contrast to international responsibility for wrongful acts, less controversial and largely sub-
ject to customary law, the very existence of international liability outside conventional norms 
has been contested.  The classic debate concerns the existence of a customary rule providing 
for liability without any wrongful act. This rule is expressly accepted in three conventional 
regimes, namely nuclear, space, and oil pollution regimes. However, there is no consensus on 
the admission of this form of liability outside conventional frameworks. 
 
The International Law Commission has examined the subject for twenty years. Meanwhile, the 
result of its work (2006 Principles on the allocation of loss) has been severely criticized by the 
scholarship. This mitigated result is due to both theoretical and practical difficulties. On the 
theoretical aspect, the ILC has been criticized for not having properly delimited the subject 
matter. Especially the relation with responsibility for wrongful acts has been criticized. Also, 
the subject is accompanied by huge economic impacts. At the core of the issue are trans-
boundary industrial and technological damages, and one could easily imagine the economic 
challenges underlying the subject.  
 
Ali Sharifi proposes a discussion on the very notion of international liability. He will argue that, 
despite technical difficulties, there exists a positive rule of international liability without wrong-
ful acts. For this, he should present an overview of different sources of international law on 
the subject. Moreover, he will examine the relation between international liability with related 
notions such as, international responsibility (for wrongful acts), due diligence and of course, 
the notion of risk.  
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